
ARTICLE   2 
To see if the Town will vote to raise and appropriate as an Operating Budget, this operating 
budget warrant article does not include appropriations contained in ANY other warrant articles, 
the amounts set forth on the budget posted with the warrant or as amended by vote of the first 
session, for the purposes set forth therein, totaling $2,965,795. Should this article be defeated, 
the default budget shall be $2,793,064, which is the same as last year, with certain adjustments 
required by previous action of the Town of Candia or by law; or the governing body may hold one 
special meeting, in accordance with RSA 40:13, X and XVI, to take up the issue of a revised 
operating budget only.  (Recommended by the Board of Selectmen by a vote of 3 to 0) 
(Recommended by the Budget Committee by a vote of ? to ?)  
 
ARTICLE  19 
To see if the town will vote to raise and appropriate the sum of $17,500.00 to the Candia Youth 
Athletic Association for the specific expenses of providing youth recreation programs to the 
children of Candia.  Said expenses to be expended under the direction of the Candia Youth 
Athletic Association Board of Directors in accordance with the approved budgets.  Submitted by 
petition (Recommended by the Board of Selectmen 3 to 0) (Recommended by the Budget 
Committee by a vote of ? to ?) 

ARTICLE  20 
Are you in favor of decreasing the Board of Selectmen to 3 Members?  Submitted by petition 
(Recommended by the Board of Selectmen 2 to 1) 

ARTICLE  21 
Shall we rescind the provisions of RSA 40:13 (known as SB2), as adopted by the Town of Candia 
on March 18th, 2006, so that the official ballot will no longer be used for voting on all questions, 
but only for the election of officers and certain other questions for which the official ballot is 
required by state law?  Submitted by petition (Recommended by the Board of Selectmen 2 to 1) 

ARTICLE  22 
Are you in favor of rescinding the Budget Committee?  Submitted by petition (Recommended by 
the Board of Selectmen 2 to 1) 

ARTICLE  36 
To see if the Town will vote to allow the operation of “Keno games” within the town of Candia at 
appropriate locations in accordance with any State Lottery Commission requirements?  Submitted 
by petition (Not recommended by the Board of Selectmen 3 – 0) 

ARTICLE  13 
To see if the town will establish a Capital Reserve Fund on Future Capital Improvements needs 
for the town of Candia and to fund the establishment of the Capital Reserve Fund  
Account of the $375,000 sale of property at exit 3 with the Selectmen named as Agents.  
(Recommended by the Board of Selectmen by a vote of 4 – 0) (Recommended by the Budget 
Committee by a vote of ? to ?)   
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